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• Waterproof • Tear-Resistant • Topographic Map
National Geographic's Trails Illustrated map of the Tower and Canyon areas of Yellowstone National Park is
designed to meet the needs of outdoor enthusiasts with unmatched detail of the north-east section of the
national park. Expertly researched and created in partnership with local land management agencies, this map
features key points of interest including Canyon Village, Roosevelt visitor area, North East Entrance Station,
Gallatin National Forest, Custer National Forest, Shoshone National Forest, Absaroka-Beartooth Wilderness,
and North Absaroka Wildereness

With many miles of mapped trails and marked Bear Management Zones the Tower, Canyon map can guide
you off the beaten path and back again. The clearly marked trails include mileages between intersections.
The map base includes contour lines and elevations for summits, passes and many lakes. Some of the many
recreation features include: visitor centers, campgrounds, trailheads, and interpretive trails.

Every Trails Illustrated map is printed on "Backcountry Tough" waterproof, tear-resistant paper. A full UTM
grid is printed on the map to aid with GPS navigation.

All proceeds from the purchase of a National Geographic map help support the Society's vital exploration,
conservation, scientific research, and education programs.

Other features found on this map include: Absaroka-Beartooth Wilderness, Beartooth Mountains, Buffalo
Plateau, Custer National Forest, Gallatin National Forest, Granite Peak, Hurricane Mesa, Lamar River,
Lower Falls of the Yellowstone River, Mount Washburn, North Absaroka Wilderness, Pilot Peak, Saddle
Mountain, Shoshone National Forest, Yellowstone National Park.

Map Scale = 1:70,000●

Sheet Size = 37.75" x 25.5"●

Folded Size = 4" x 7.5"●
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From reader reviews:

Pedro Engle:

This Tower, Canyon: Yellowstone National Park NE (National Geographic Trails Illustrated Map) book is
absolutely not ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you have by
reading this book is information inside this book incredible fresh, you will get info which is getting deeper an
individual read a lot of information you will get. That Tower, Canyon: Yellowstone National Park NE
(National Geographic Trails Illustrated Map) without we realize teach the one who reading through it
become critical in imagining and analyzing. Don't end up being worry Tower, Canyon: Yellowstone National
Park NE (National Geographic Trails Illustrated Map) can bring once you are and not make your carrier
space or bookshelves' turn into full because you can have it in your lovely laptop even mobile phone. This
Tower, Canyon: Yellowstone National Park NE (National Geographic Trails Illustrated Map) having
excellent arrangement in word in addition to layout, so you will not sense uninterested in reading.

Richard Hennessy:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to opt for book like
comic, short story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not striving Tower, Canyon: Yellowstone
National Park NE (National Geographic Trails Illustrated Map) that give your enjoyment preference will be
satisfied through reading this book. Reading routine all over the world can be said as the opportinity for
people to know world much better then how they react toward the world. It can't be explained constantly that
reading behavior only for the geeky man but for all of you who wants to end up being success person. So ,
for every you who want to start examining as your good habit, you may pick Tower, Canyon: Yellowstone
National Park NE (National Geographic Trails Illustrated Map) become your own starter.

Jeffery Fulmer:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray anyone, why because this Tower, Canyon: Yellowstone National Park
NE (National Geographic Trails Illustrated Map) reserve written by well-known writer we are excited for
well how to make book that may be understand by anyone who else read the book. Written within good
manner for you, leaking every ideas and creating skill only for eliminate your current hunger then you still
question Tower, Canyon: Yellowstone National Park NE (National Geographic Trails Illustrated Map) as
good book but not only by the cover but also through the content. This is one e-book that can break don't
determine book by its protect, so do you still needing one more sixth sense to pick this specific!? Oh come
on your reading through sixth sense already told you so why you have to listening to one more sixth sense.

Susan Douglas:

This Tower, Canyon: Yellowstone National Park NE (National Geographic Trails Illustrated Map) is great
reserve for you because the content which can be full of information for you who have always deal with
world and possess to make decision every minute. This kind of book reveal it info accurately using great



arrange word or we can point out no rambling sentences in it. So if you are read the idea hurriedly you can
have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only will give you straight forward sentences but challenging core
information with splendid delivering sentences. Having Tower, Canyon: Yellowstone National Park NE
(National Geographic Trails Illustrated Map) in your hand like getting the world in your arm, facts in it is not
ridiculous one particular. We can say that no reserve that offer you world throughout ten or fifteen moment
right but this book already do that. So , this really is good reading book. Hi Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you
still doubt which?
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