
Poetry and Mysticism
Colin Wilson

Click here if your download doesn"t start automatically

http://bookengine.site/go/read.php?id=0872861821
http://bookengine.site/go/read.php?id=0872861821
http://bookengine.site/go/read.php?id=0872861821


Poetry and Mysticism

Colin Wilson

Poetry and Mysticism Colin Wilson

The mystic's moment of illumination shares with great poetry the liberating power of the deepest levels of
consciousness. In the words of William Blake, "If the doors of perception were cleansed, everything would
appear to a man as it is, infinite."

Poetry, Wilson argues, is a contradiction of the habitual prison of daily life and shows the way to transcend
the ordinary world through an act of intense attention-and intention. The poet, like the mystic, is subject to
sudden ""peak experiences"" when ""everything we look upon is blessed."" W.B. Yeats, Dostoevsky,
Gautama Buddha, Kazantzakis, Van Gogh, Rupert Brooke, Arunja, Nietzsche, A.L. Rouse, Jacob Boehme,
Suzuki, Edgar Allan Poe: their visionary understanding can generate an awareness in each of us of our
potential to open the floodgates of inner energy that creates mystic experience.

Colin Wilson first received international acclaim in 1956 for The Outsider. ""Ever since I was thirteen, I
have been obsessed by the question of the nature of mystical experience,"" he writes, and from that time he
has been on a quest of the mystical in poetry, religion, and psychology.
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From reader reviews:

David Ashworth:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to be aware of everything in the world. Each book has different aim or even goal; it means that
guide has different type. Some people truly feel enjoy to spend their time for you to read a book. These are
reading whatever they have because their hobby is definitely reading a book. What about the person who
don't like examining a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book when they found difficult problem or
perhaps exercise. Well, probably you should have this Poetry and Mysticism.

Charles Aranda:

This Poetry and Mysticism is completely new way for you who has intense curiosity to look for some
information mainly because it relief your hunger info. Getting deeper you upon it getting knowledge more
you know or perhaps you who still having bit of digest in reading this Poetry and Mysticism can be the light
food for you personally because the information inside that book is easy to get by simply anyone. These
books acquire itself in the form that is reachable by anyone, that's why I mean in the e-book type. People
who think that in e-book form make them feel drowsy even dizzy this reserve is the answer. So there is
absolutely no in reading a reserve especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be
here for a person. So , don't miss that! Just read this e-book style for your better life and also knowledge.

Kathleen Huckaby:

As a university student exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the
library as well as to make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just small students that has
reading's heart and soul or real their pastime. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to the library.
They go to right now there but nothing reading critically. Any students feel that reading through is not
important, boring and also can't see colorful photographs on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is
very important to suit your needs. As we know that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we
wish. Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's country. Therefore , this Poetry and Mysticism can
make you truly feel more interested to read.

Virginia White:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is composed or printed or descriptive from each source that filled update of news.
With this modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for you. From media social
including newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic. You can
add your understanding by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just in search of
the Poetry and Mysticism when you needed it?
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