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"One foot in front of the other. Breathe in, breathe out." Holly Ashton hasn't celebrated her birthday since her
mother passed away. Instead, it's the one day of the year that she allows herself to grieve. The rest of the year
is spent pretending to be the strong and independent woman she wants to be. Professionally, she has it all
together. A great job as an architect at Sydney's most prestigious firm keeps her focused. Her personal life is
far less charmed. Emotionally detached from everyone other than her small circle of friends and family,
relationships are a no-go zone. Life is exactly how she wants it to be - until the day of her twenty-fifth
birthday. A chance encounter with Ryan Davenport, CEO of a property development firm, turns her tightly
controlled life upside down. Ryan is driven, ambitious and used to getting what he wants - and very
unexpectedly, what he wants is the beautiful, smart-mouthed Holly Ashton. When neither of them believes in
happily ever afters, how are they supposed to find their own?
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From reader reviews:

Randy Garrison:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive today, people
have do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice by
surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated this for a while is reading. That's
why, by reading a guide your ability to survive boost then having chance to stay than other is high. To suit
your needs who want to start reading any book, we give you this specific [(The Holly Project)] [By (author)
K a Sterritt] published on (October, 2014) book as starter and daily reading publication. Why, because this
book is more than just a book.

Corey Smith:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also become a life style. This reading routine
give you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge the actual information
inside the book which improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind
of publication you read, if you want drive more knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you want
sense happy read one together with theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. The [(The Holly
Project)] [By (author) K a Sterritt] published on (October, 2014) is kind of e-book which is giving the reader
unforeseen experience.

Florence Davis:

This book untitled [(The Holly Project)] [By (author) K a Sterritt] published on (October, 2014) to be one of
several books in which best seller in this year, here is because when you read this guide you can get a lot of
benefit into it. You will easily to buy this particular book in the book store or you can order it by using
online. The publisher of this book sells the e-book too. It makes you easier to read this book, since you can
read this book in your Cell phone. So there is no reason to you to past this book from your list.

Timothy Duchene:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With reading through you can get a lot of
information that may give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world can easily
share their idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire their very own reader with
their story or perhaps their experience. Not only situation that share in the books. But also they write about
advantage about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
young ones, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors in this world always try to improve
their ability in writing, they also doing some study before they write for their book. One of them is this [(The
Holly Project)] [By (author) K a Sterritt] published on (October, 2014).
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