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Statistics for People Who (Think They) Hate Statistics: Using Microsoft Excel 2016, Fourth Edition
presents an often intimidating and difficult subject in a way that is clear, informative, and personable.
Researchers and students will appreciate the book's unhurried pace and thorough, friendly presentation.
Opening with an introduction to Excel 2016, including coverage of how to use functions and formulas, this
edition also shows students how to install the Excel Data Analysis Tools option to access a host of useful
analytical techniques. The book walks readers through various statistical procedures, beginning with simple
descriptive statistics, correlations, and graphical representations of data, and ending with inferential
techniques, analysis of variance, and a new introductory chapter on working with large datasets and data
mining using Excel.
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From reader reviews:

Rose Cotner:

Book is definitely written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can realize everything you want by a
reserve. Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important matter to bring us around the
world. Beside that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A e-book Statistics for People Who (Think
They) Hate Statistics: Using Microsoft Excel 2016 will make you to always be smarter. You can feel more
confidence if you can know about everything. But some of you think in which open or reading some sort of
book make you bored. It is far from make you fun. Why they are often thought like that? Have you trying to
find best book or acceptable book with you?

John Folsom:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important together with you? Or just adding material when you
want something to explain what the one you have problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy
particular person? If you don't have spare time to accomplish others business, it is make you feel bored
faster. And you have spare time? What did you do? Everyone has many questions above. The doctor has to
answer that question due to the fact just their can do which. It said that about guide. Book is familiar on
every person. Yes, it is suitable. Because start from on guardería until university need that Statistics for
People Who (Think They) Hate Statistics: Using Microsoft Excel 2016 to read.

Helen Leavitt:

This book untitled Statistics for People Who (Think They) Hate Statistics: Using Microsoft Excel 2016 to be
one of several books that best seller in this year, honestly, that is because when you read this book you can
get a lot of benefit on it. You will easily to buy that book in the book retail outlet or you can order it through
online. The publisher on this book sells the e-book too. It makes you easier to read this book, since you can
read this book in your Touch screen phone. So there is no reason for your requirements to past this
publication from your list.

Michele Sexton:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to try and do! A lot of people spent their down time with their family, or
all their friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, planning to beach, or picnic in the park.
They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something different to fill your
own free time/ holiday? May be reading a book might be option to fill your free of charge time/ holiday. The
first thing that you will ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If you want to test look for
book, may be the publication untitled Statistics for People Who (Think They) Hate Statistics: Using
Microsoft Excel 2016 can be excellent book to read. May be it can be best activity to you.
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