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We all know about the Power of Positive Thinking and we've all heard about the Law of Attraction. What is
fascinating, with pictures and text for the layman, is HOW and WHY these things work -- with some real
insights into the Soul-Mind connection and how Vision really works. The Quantum Physicists did not set out
to prove the reality behind Metaphysics, but their latest discoveries, and those of a Cognitive Neuroscientist
from South Africa, have discovered the processes at work and this book examines how Man functions in
what have been called Reality Fields. Our world appears to consist of Zero Point Energy, torsion waves and
holographic interference waves -- and our subconscious mind uses and decodes them. In addition, the book
examines Nutrition for the Brain so that the reader has a starting point to choose to avoid Age Related
Dementia, or not. And a new field of Quantum Biology is examined and what that means for the future of
medicine, agriculture and science as a whole. Spiritual insights, humor and Man-Woman differences are
examined, as well as basic Brain 101 information-- all intended to be useful daily information, as opposed to
scientific talk. A lengthy section (in Ch. 9) examines why violent video games harm our youth and how it is
done via prions in our brains. Lastly, Vision is examined even to the point of showing how the Eye-Brain
connection can and does deceive us. Vision is a quantum process called tunneling and the Visual Cortex is
not what you were told it was (in high school). Vision is holographic, as the late Michael Talbot said, and
that raises the issue of what kind of a world we are really living in, what anomalons are, what is going on
with the Double-Slit Experiment, and more. This is a fascinating look at Man and his world via the latest
Quantum Mechanics discoveries. Then, further insights can be gained via two related books: Transformation
of Man and Quantum Earth Simulation. More than brain candy, Man is part of the Hologram and interfaces it
thru his Mind. The purpose? Earth is a School and the more he knows about himself, and the wonders of his
Reality, the more he becomes an Earth Graduate and moves on to PARTICIPATE in running the World and
Metaverse around him... Earth is only the beginning. Note: this book expands and replaces the Amplified
Science of Mind.
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From reader reviews:

Lacey Clements:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to be aware of everything in the world. Each guide has different aim or even goal; it means that
e-book has different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. These are reading
whatever they take because their hobby is actually reading a book. What about the person who don't like
looking at a book? Sometime, man feel need book once they found difficult problem or maybe exercise.
Well, probably you will want this The Science in Metaphysics.

Kelly Livingston:

Now a day those who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources inside can be true or not involve people to be aware of each facts they get. How many people to be
smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Studying a book can help
men and women out of this uncertainty Information especially this The Science in Metaphysics book because
this book offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course the data in this book hundred pct guarantees
there is no doubt in it as you know.

Phyllis Greenfield:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our information for everything. By a book we can know
everything we really wish for. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every
year ended up being exactly added. This publication The Science in Metaphysics was filled with regards to
science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your technology competence. Some people has
diverse feel when they reading any book. If you know how big selling point of a book, you can truly feel
enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern era like now, many ways to get book that you wanted.

Donald Oakes:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got students? We believe that that concern
was given by teacher on their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. And you also
know that little person such as reading or as studying become their hobby. You must know that reading is
very important and book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to increase you knowledge, except your
personal teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update concerning something by book. Numerous books
that can you choose to use be your object. One of them is niagra The Science in Metaphysics.
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