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The fantasyland of Oz continues to fascinate steadfast Oz fans. They sympathize with the tin woodsman in
his need for a heart, the cowardly lion in his need for courage, and with Dorothy as she searches for a way to
return home to Kansas. In The Origin of The Wonderful Wizard of Oz, author Michele Rubatino reveals the
mystery behind the evidence regarding the source of the maps found in Tik-Tok of Oz.

Rubatino discusses the origin of the maps that Baum claims he discovered, rather than penned from his own
imagination. The Origin of The Wonderful Wizard of Oz provides evidence to show the maps found in the
Oz books, forty of them in all, were derived from drawing blueprints taken from the text of a King James
Version Bible dating from around 1611.

This information found by Baum formed the foundation for the creation of this fantasy series. Rubatino's
discovery will help Oz enthusiasts, theologians, and all interested in the works of Baum to decipher the many
facets he included in his stories. It will help fans gain a better perspective on the mysteries still to be found in
the Bible and the Oz series.
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From reader reviews:

Lisa Knight:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? That's
why, you can choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time
to take a stroll, shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open or perhaps read a book allowed The
Origin of The Wonderful Wizard of Oz? Maybe it is to become best activity for you. You already know
beside you can spend your time with your favorite's book, you can cleverer than before. Do you agree with
its opinion or you have other opinion?

Herb Baker:

Book is written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can realize everything you want by a e-book.
Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important thing to bring us around the world.
Alongside that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A book The Origin of The Wonderful Wizard
of Oz will make you to always be smarter. You can feel more confidence if you can know about anything.
But some of you think which open or reading a book make you bored. It's not make you fun. Why they can
be thought like that? Have you trying to find best book or ideal book with you?

William Chestnut:

A lot of people always spent their particular free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them
family or their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching TV, as
well as playing video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity that's look different you
can read some sort of book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book which you read you can spent
the entire day to reading a e-book. The book The Origin of The Wonderful Wizard of Oz it is very good to
read. There are a lot of folks that recommended this book. These people were enjoying reading this book.
Should you did not have enough space to develop this book you can buy the e-book. You can m0ore very
easily to read this book from the smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this book offers high
quality.

Shelly Reder:

Many people spending their period by playing outside with friends, fun activity with family or just watching
TV all day every day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by reading through a book.
Ugh, think reading a book can really hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It all right you can
have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like The Origin of The Wonderful
Wizard of Oz which is obtaining the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's find.
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